F\MIATAKANO\TAKANO_026. XML

AMENDMENT TO H.R. 1806

OFFERED BY MR. TAKANO OF CALIFORNIA

In section 101(a)(1), strike “$7,597,140,000” and
nsert “$7,693,710,000".

In section 101(a)(2)(B), strike “$866,000,000” and
insert “$962,570,000".

In section 101(b)(1), strike “$7,597,140,000” and
insert “$7,693,710,000”.

In section 101(b)(2)(B), strike “$866,000,000” and
msert “$962,570,000".

fA\VHLC\041715\041715.217.xml (598115I1)
April 17,2015 (4:11 p.m.)




  
   F:\M14\TAKANO\TAKANO_026.XML 4/17/2015 16:11 04/17/2015 16:07   1141-0417-519671 598115|1  
 
 [Discussion Draft] 
 
 [Discussion Draft] 
  
  
 
  
  
 114th CONGRESS  1st Session 
 Amendment to H.R. 1806 
  
 Offered by  Mr. Takano of California 
  
 
 
    
  In section 101(a)(1), strike  $7,597,140,000 and insert  $7,693,710,000.  
  In section 101(a)(2)(B), strike  $866,000,000 and insert  $962,570,000. 
  In section 101(b)(1), strike  $7,597,140,000 and insert  $7,693,710,000. 
  In section 101(b)(2)(B), strike  $866,000,000 and insert  $962,570,000. 

