FATB\SC\COMPET15_002. XML

AMENDMENT TO H.R. 1806
Orrerep BY MsS. EDWARDS

In section 301(1), strike “$4,550,000” and insert
“$5,550,000".

In section 301(2), strike “$4,550,000” and insert
“$5,550,000".

fAVHLC\041715\041715.132.xml (59805511)
April 17, 2015 (2:00 p.m.)



