F:\MI4\BEYER\BEYER_010.XML

AMENDMENT TO H.R. 1806

OFFERED BY MR. BEYER OF VIRGINIA

In section 101(a)(1), strike “$7,597,140,000”
insert “$7,626,980,000”.

In section 101(a)(2)(D), strike “$325,000,000”
insert “$354,840,000”.

In section 101(b)(1), strike “$7,597,140,000”
insert “$7,626,980,000”.

In section 101(b)(2)(D), strike “$325,000,000”
msert “$354,840,000".

f:\VHLC\042015\042015.456.xml (59852612)
April 20, 2015 (10:32 p.m.)

and

and

and

and




  
   F:\M14\BEYER\BEYER_010.XML 4/20/2015 22:32 04/20/2015 22:12  
  598526|2
  
 
 [Discussion Draft] 
 
 [Discussion Draft] 
  
  
 
  
  
 114th CONGRESS  1st Session 
 Amendment to H.R. 1806 
  
 Offered by  Mr. Beyer of Virginia 
  
 
 
    
  In section 101(a)(1), strike  $7,597,140,000 and insert  $7,626,980,000.   
  In section 101(a)(2)(D), strike  $325,000,000 and insert  $354,840,000.   
  In section 101(b)(1), strike  $7,597,140,000 and insert  $7,626,980,000.   
  In section 101(b)(2)(D), strike  $325,000,000 and insert  $354,840,000.  

